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*® Business communications * Political Consulting * News Releases * Video Productions
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April 7,20@

INVOICE
PO #0684635

To: Teresa Martinez, City of ABQ, Environmental Heaith Department
From: Joe Monahan,

Please remit the sun{of $252 Qvioes rendered to the City of Albugquerque for the

period March 16 thru April 7, 2004. 42 hours @60.00 per hour to:

Joe Monahan

1331 Park Avenue SW #404
Albuguerque, NM 87102
505-243-4059
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1331 Park Ave. SW, Suite 404 » Albuquerque, NM 87102 ¢ Phone (505) 243-4059 » FAX (505) 243-4224

I T T




1331 Park Ave.

Monahan Marketing

SW, Suite 404 » Albuquerque, NM 87102

Phone (505) 243-4059 * FAX (505) 243-4224

* Business communications *

June 1, 2004

—
INVOICE

PO #0684635

To: Teresa Martinez, City of ABQ, Environmental Health Depa

From: Joe Monahan,

emiail: jmonahan@ix.netcom.com

]

Please remit the sum m
period April 8 thru May‘SSthours @60.00 per hour to:

Joe Monahan

1331 Park Avenue SW #404

Albuquerque, NM 87102
505-243-4059

1331 Park Ave. SW, Suite 404 * Albuq

Environmental Heaith Department
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FROM :Joa Monahan FRX NO. :50@52434224 Jun. 28 2004 P1:27PM F3

Monahan Marketing

1331 Pazk Ave| SW, Suite 404 » Alb ucrque.NM87102
" Phone (505) 2434059 « FAX (505) 2434224
ail: jmonahan@ix, netcom.com
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- Albuquerque, NM 87102
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JUN-B5-2005  10:42 FROM:CITY OF ALBUGUERGUE SB5 768 1977 T0: 5057682668 P.19/10

Monahan Marketing

N 1331 Park Ave! SW, Suite 404 » Albuquerque, NM 87102 I
Phane (505) 243-4059 * FAX (505) 243-4224 Ty
email: jmonahan@ix.neecom.com L
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May 24, 2005

INVOICE
PO#0000686084

To: Teresa Martinez, City of ABQ, Environmental Health Department

Please remit the sum of $6875.0Q for public relations, marketing and oonsulﬁngﬁvices
rendered to the city of Albuquerque for the period March 15 thru May 24, 2005 to:

Joe Monahan
1331 Park Avenye SW #404
Albuquergue, NA 87102
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1331 Park Ave. SW, Suite 404 ¢ Albuquerque, NM 87102 » Phone (505) 243-4059 « FAX (505) 243-4224




JUN-25-2005, 18: 42 FROM:CITY OF ALBUGUERGUE 585 768 1977 TO: 5857682668 P.9/10
City of Albuquerque
Environmental Health Department
Alfredo R, Santistovan, Director
May 24, 2005
To: Christella Armijo, Mbnitoring Section Supervisor (%k

Through:  John Liberato
From: Therese Martinez-
Subject: Alr Aware II Gas Ca

cation, Outreach, & Technical Assistance Section Supervisor
‘Q‘k/ﬁ

Exchange Project - Mr. Joe Monahan- PR Seyrvlces

Attached is the invoice for public relations’ services provided by Mr. Monahan under his contract for the
Air Aware I - Gas Can Exchange Project. This concludes his service contract that should be paid from

the 265 Fund and the 5650350 Activity.




